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Cost Tabulation/Notice of Respondents Procurement Team

Contract No./Title: REQ-0003276 — Crane Maintenance, Repair and Inspection Services
Date: 3/20/2026

Crane Technologies Group, Inc. | Royal Arc Welding Company
Estimated Total Extended Total Extended
# Items Quantity Unit Price Cost Unit Price Cost
WRRF & CSO Basins
1 | 1st Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 96 $ 133.50 | $ 12,816.00 | $ 411.00 | $ 39,456.00
2 | 2nd Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 96 $ 356.00 | $ 34,176.00 | $ 322.00 | $ 30,912.00
3 | 3rd Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 96 $ 133.50 | $ 12,816.00 | $ 411.00 | $ 39,456.00
4 | 4t Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 96 $ 356.00 | $ 34,176.00 | $ 322.00 | $ 30,912.00
Water Plants & Pumping Stations
1 | 1st Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 70 $ 133.50 | $ 9,345.00 | $ 411.00 | $ 28,770.00
2 | 2nd Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 70 $ 356.00 | $ 24,920.00 | $ 322.00 | $ 22,540.00
3 | 3rd Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 70 $ 133.50 | $ 9,345.00 | $ 411.00 | $ 28,770.00
4 | 4t Quarter MIOSHA Inspection for Cranes and Hoists 70 $ 356.00 | $ 24920.00 | $ 322.00 | $ 22,540.00
Allowance - Not to Exceed
1 | Parts and Labor Cost for Repairs 1 $ 525,000.00 | $ 525,000.00 | $ 525,000.00 | $ 525,000.00
Parts Discount
1 | Parts (with warranty) at __% Discount from Supplier’s published parts list 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Labor Rates
1| N ormal working hours (Mon-Fri 7am-5pm) 1 $ 13500 |$ 13500 | $  140.00 | $ 140.00
Holidays (New Year’s Day, Memorial Day, Independence Day, Labor Day,

2 | Thanksgiving Day and Christmas Day) 1 $ 256.00 | $ 256.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 280.00
3 | During any other time/day (other than normal business hours or holidays) 1 $ 185.00 | § 185.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 210.00

Total Bid Amount ( Locations and Allowance) $ 687,514.00 $ 768,356.00
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