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#0-1 Design/Build Contractor 1 Clark Ghafari Design/Build $440,431.00 $440,431.00 CCC Prime Prime Contractor $442,000.00 $442,000.00

#0-2 Subcontractor 1 Clark Murray Paint Cleaning $746,856.00 $746,856.00 CCC HRC Designer $35,000.00 $35,000.00

#0-3 Subcontractor 1 Clark Murray Paint Painting $241,244.00 $241,244.00 CCC Signature Contracting Cleaning/Paint $900,000.00 $900,000.00

#0-4 Subcontractor 1 Clark Rotor Electric Electrical $219,500.00 $219,500.00 CCC Seaway Scaffolding Scaffolding Contractor $850,000.00 $850,000.00

#0-5 Subcontractor 1 Clark Heineman Scaffolding $498,382.00 $498,382.00 CCC Rotor Electric Electrical $235,000.00 $235,000.00

#0-6 Subcontractor 1 Clark Testing Engineers Industrial Hygienist $4,000.00 $4,000.00 CCC Liberty Sheet Metal Wall Siding $125,000.00 $125,000.00

#0-7 Subcontractor 1 Clark Christen Detroit Wall Panels $65,000.00 $65,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-8 Subcontractor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-9 Subcontractor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-10 Subcontractor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-11 Subcontractor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-12 Subcontractor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-13 Subcontractor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#0-14 Subcontractor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Cost

RFP - 2004735

Cost Breakdown by D/B Contractor/Subcontractor Table

Design/Build Contract for Incineration Complex Fire Repairs

Clark Construction Company Commercial Contracting Corporation

$2,215,413.00 $2,587,000.00


